

MS1 Play Value	MS2 Product Range		MS3 Added Value		MS4 Warranty / Guarantee		MS5 Presentation		Qual Score %
	Score	Weighting x5	Score	Weighting x1	Score	Weighting x2	Score	Weighting x1	
	Weighting x7								
25	3	15	4	4	4	8	3.0	3.0	54.50
28	4	20	4	4	4	8	4.0	4.0	64.00
28	4	20	4	4	3	6	3.5	3.5	61.50
21	3	15	4	4	4	8	3.5	3.5	51.50
25	4	20	4	4	4	8	3.0	3.0	59.50

Rank

No Return 4
NO BID 1
No Return 2
NO BID 5
No Return 3

PRICE Evaluation Model

Price	$\frac{\text{price} - \text{lowest price}}{\text{lowest price}} = \% \text{ above lowest price}$	100% - % above lowest price	Maximum points x (100% - % above lowest price)	Final Score %	Rank
return					No Return
00.00	0.0000	1.00	20.00%	20.00	2
BID					NO BID
00.00	0.0000	1.00	20.00%	20.00	2
return					No Return
return					No Return
00.00	0.0000	1.00	20.00%	20.00	2
BID					NO BID
return					No Return
99.66	0.0000	1.00	20.00%	20.00	1
00.00	0.0000	1.00	20.00%	20.00	2

999.66

,000.00

MS1		MS2		MS3		MS4		MS5		Rank
Play Value		Product Range		Added Value		Warranty / Guarantee		Presentation		Qual Score %
Score	Weighting x7	Score	Weighting x5	Score	Weighting x1	Score	Weighting x2	Score	Weighting x1	
3.5	25	3	15	4	4	4	8	3.0	3.0	54.50
4.0	28	4	20	4	4	4	8	4.0	4.0	64.00
4.0	28	4	20	4	4	3	6	3.5	3.5	61.50
3.0	21	3	15	4	4	4	8	3.5	3.5	51.50
3.5	25	4	20	4	4	4	8	3.0	3.0	59.50

No Return	4
NO BID	1
No Return	2
No Return	5
NO BID	3